

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
**P. O. BOX 2449**  
**SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449**  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Personal Protective Glovegear  
 TIME A: (June 1, 2015 through May 31, 2016)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2015

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1121 Fountain Pkwy Grand Prairie, TX 7550	R.S. Hughes Co. 5018 Service Center Drive San Antonio, TX 78218	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Alamo Iron Works 943 A/T&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Magid Glove & Safety 1300 Naperville Drive Romeoville, IL 60446	Mastermans, LLP 11 C Street Auburn, MA 01501	Sumbell Mill Supply 7715 Grissom Rd San Antonio, TX 78251	Abatix Corporation 610 Larnark, Suite 203A San Antonio, TX 78218	W Supply, LLC 4601 S Pinemont Dr. Houston, TX 77041	Baytech Supply	CCP Industries, Inc.				
1.	300 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 9, Lawson No. 12974	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.24 1,272.00	4.15 1,245.00	3.84 1,152.00	4.88 1,464.00	GROUP 1 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED	5.16 1,548.00	4.16 1,248.00	3.96 1,188.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID				
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	6 dz/72 pr Cordova 4522L	1 dz PIP-50-N2272G 616314-35609	72 pr/cs MCR5350L	Memphis 5350L		12 MCR 5350L	12 PIP 50-N2272G	72 Memphis 5350							
2.	300 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 10, Lawson No. 12977	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.24 1,272.00	4.15 1,245.00	3.84 1,152.00	4.88 1,464.00		5.16 1,548.00	4.16 1,248.00	3.96 1,188.00							
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	6 dz/72 pr Cordova 4522XL	1 dz PIP-50-N2272G 616314-35593	72 pr/cs MCR 5350 XL	Memphis 5350 XL		12 MCR 5350XL	12 PIP 50-N2272G	72 Memphis 5350							
3.	200 pairs Nitrile gloves (Item A-1 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Size 11, Lawson No. 12971	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.24 848.00	4.15 830.00	3.84 768.00	4.88 976.00		5.16 1,032.00	4.16 832.00	3.96 792.00							
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	6 dz/72 pr Cordova 4522-2XL	1 dz PIP-50-N2272G 616314-35616	72 pr/cs 5350 XXL	Memphis 5350 XXL		12 MCR 5350XXL	12 PIP 50-N2272G	72 Memphis 5350							
<b>GROUP 1 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	3,392.00	3,320.00 3,318.34 Discount	3,072.00 3,010.56 Discount	3,904.00		4,128.00	3,328.00	3,168.00							
<b>GROUP 2</b>	<b>GLOVE A-2 NITRILE GLOVES DISPOSABLE</b>																
1.	50 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size Small, Lawson No. 12973)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.22 311.00	5.06 253.00	4.55 227.50	5.83 291.50		6.64 332.00	11.69 584.50	5.63 281.50				5.00 250.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	50 ea P.I.P. 63-338/\$	50 ea MCR-6005 6005 S	20 bxs/cs/50 ea/bx MCR 6005 S	20 PIP 63-338/S		50 Liberty 2008W	100 MCR 6005S	50/bx PIP 63-338				50 Memphis 6005			
2.	100 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size Medium, Lawson No. 12972)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.22 622.00	5.06 506.00	4.55 455.00	5.83 583.00	6.64 664.00	11.69 1,169.00	5.63 563.00	5.00 500.00							
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	50 ea P.I.P. 63-338/M	50 ea MCR-6005 6005 M	20 bxs/cs/50 ea/bx MCR 6005 M	20 PIP 63-338/M	50 Liberty 2008W	100 MCR 6005M	50/bx PIP 63-338	50 Memphis 6005							
3.	2,500 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glove wear, Size Large, Lawson No. 12968)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.22 15,550.00	5.06 12,650.00	4.55 11,375.00	5.83 14,575.00	6.64 16,600.00	11.69 29,225.00	5.63 14,075.00	5.00 12,500.00							
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	50 ea P.I.P. 63-338/L	50 ea MCR-6005 6005 L	20 bxs/cs/50 ea/bx MCR 6005 L	20 PIP 63-338/L	50 Liberty 2008W	100 MCR 6005L	50/bx PIP 63-338	50 Memphis 6005							
4.	5,000 box Nitrile disposable gloves (8 mil thick) (Item A-2 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear, Size X Large, Lawson No. 12976)	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6.22 31,100.00	5.06 25,300.00	4.55 22,750.00	5.83 29,150.00	6.64 33,200.00	11.69 58,450.00	5.63 28,150.00	5.00 25,000.00							
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	50 ea P.I.P. 63-338/XL	50 ea MCR-6005 6005 XL	20 bxs/cs/50 ea/bx MCR 6005 XL	20 PIP 63-338/XL	50 Liberty 2008W	100 MCR 6005XL	50/bx PIP 63-338	50 Memphis 6005							
<b>GROUP 2 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	47,583.00	38,709.00 38,689.65 Discount	34,807.50 34,111.35 Discount	44,599.50	50,796.00	89,428.50	43,069.50	38,250.00							
<b>GROUP 3</b>	<b>GLOVE A-3 WORK GLOVE, COWHIDE</b>																
1.	800 pairs Cowhide work gloves, (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glove wear) Size Small, Lawson No. 12986	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.40 3,520.00	4.33 3,464.00	4.15 3,320.00	4.43 3,544.00		4.32 3,456.00	4.28 3,424.00	4.14 3,312.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID				
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-\$	12 PIP-68163 616314-08450	120 pr/cs MCR 3213S	10 dz PIP 68-163/S		12 Liberty 6137S	12 pr/box PIP 68-163	120 Memphis 3213							

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR: Annual Contract for Personal Protective Glovegear  
 DATE: (June 1, 2015 through May 31, 2016)  
 DATE: 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1121 Fountain Pkwy Grand Prairie, TX 75501	R.S. Hughes Co. 5018 Service Center Drive San Antonio, TX 78218	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Alamo Iron Works 943 AT&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Magid Glove & Safety 1300 Naperville Drive Romeoville, IL 60446	Mastermans, LLP 11 C Street Auburn, MA 01501	Sunbelt Mill Supply 7715 Crissom Rd. San Antonio, TX 78251	Abatix Corporation 610 Lanark, Suite 203A San Antonio, TX 78218	W Supply, LLC 4601 S Pinemont Dr. Houston, TX 77041	Baytech Supply	CCP Industries, Inc.																				
2.	2,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves, (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glove wear) Size Medium, Lawson No. 12984	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.40 8,800.00	4.33 8,660.00	4.15 8,300.00	4.43 8,860.00	GROUP 3 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED	4.32 8,640.00	4.28 8,560.00	4.14 8,280.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID																				
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-M	12 PIP 68-163 616314-08467	120 pr/cs MCR 3213M	10/dz PIP 68-163/M		120 Liberty 6137M	12 pr/bx PIP 68-163	120 Memphis 3213																							
3.	4,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovegear) Size Large, Lawson No. 12982	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.40 17,600.00	4.33 17,320.00	4.15 16,600.00	4.43 17,720.00		GROUP 3 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED	4.32 17,280.00	4.28 17,120.00				4.14 16,560.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID																
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-L	12 PIP 68-163 616314-08474	120 pr/cs MCR 3213L	10/dz PIP 68-163/L			12 Liberty 6137L	12 pr/bx PIP 68-163				120 Memphis 3213																			
4.	2,500 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovegear) Size X Large, Lawson No. 12987	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.60 11,500.00	4.51 11,275.00	4.34 10,850.00	4.60 11,500.00			GROUP 3 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED	4.32 10,800.00				4.45 11,125.00				4.14 10,350.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID												
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-XL	12 PIP 68-163 61634-08481	120 pr/cs MCR 3213XL	10/dz PIP 68-163/XL				12 Liberty 6137XL				12 pr/bx PIP 68-163				120 Memphis 3213															
5.	1,000 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovegear) Size 2X Large, Lawson No. 12979	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.86 4,860.00	4.77 4,770.00	4.57 4,570.00	4.88 4,880.00				GROUP 3 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED				4.58 4,580.00				4.70 4,700.00				4.50 4,500.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID								
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-2XL	12 PIP 68-163 616314-02809	120 pr/cs MCR 3213XXL	10/dz PIP 163-163/XXL								12 Liberty 6137XXL				12 pr/bx PIP 68-163				120 Memphis 3213											
6.	20 pairs Cowhide work gloves (Item A-3 per SAWS specifications for basic personal glovegear) Size 3X Large, Lawson No. 12980	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	5.16 103.20	5.04 100.80	4.85 97.00	5.15 103.00								GROUP 3 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED				4.75 95.00				5.08 101.60				4.71 94.20	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID				
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	10 dz/120 pr Cordova 8210-3XL	12 PIP-68-163 616314-12371	120 pr/cs MCR 3213XXXL	10/dz PIP 68-163/XXXL												12 Liberty 6137XXXL				12 pr/bx PIP 68-163				120 Memphis 3213							
<b>GROUP 3 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	46,383.20	45,589.80 Discount	43,737.00 Discount	46,607.00												GROUP 4 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED				44,851.00				45,030.60				43,096.20	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID
1.	96 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Size Small, Lawson No. 12947	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.36 418.56	5.01 480.96	2.68 257.28	5.12 491.52																GROUP 4 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED				5.32 510.72				3.09 296.64			
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 pairs Marigold/Comasec 113914	12 PIP 55-1635 616314-24105	144 pr/cs MCR 6885S	6/dz PIP 555-1635/S	72 PIP 55-1635/S				12 pr/bx MCR 6885	144 PIP 55-1635																					
2.	250 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Size Medium, Lawson No. 12946	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.36 1,090.00	5.01 1,252.50	2.68 670.00	5.12 1,280.00	GROUP 4 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED				5.32 1,330.00	3.09 772.50	4.59 1,147.50													BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM				NO BID			
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 pairs Marigold/Comasec 113531	12 PIP 55-1635 616314-24099	144 pr/cs MCR 6885M	6/dz PIP 55-1635/M		72 PIP 55-1635/M			12 pr/bx MCR 6885	144 PIP 55-1635																					
3.	800 pairs Rubber coated, rib knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Size Large, Lawson No. 12945	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4.36 3,488.00	5.01 4,008.00	2.68 2,144.00	5.12 4,096.00		GROUP 4 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED			5.32 4,256.00	3.09 2,472.00	4.59 3,672.00		BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID																
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 pairs Marigold/Comasec 113532	12 PIP 55-1635 616314-24082	144 pr/cs MCR 6885L	6/dz PIP 55-1635/L			72 PIP 55-1635/L		12 pr/bx MCR 6885	144 PIP 55-1635																					

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL: Annual Contract for  
 FOR: Personal Protective Glovegear  
 TIME & DATE: (June 1, 2015 through May 31, 2016)  
 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2015

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1121 Fountain Pkwy Grand Prairie, TX 7550	R.S. Hughes Co. 5018 Service Center Drive San Antonio, TX 78218	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Alamo Iron Works 943 A1&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Magid Glove & Safety 1300 Naperville Drive Romeoville, IL 60446	Mastermans, LLP 11 C Street Auburn, MA 01501	Sumbell Mill Supply 7715 Grissom Rd. San Antonio, TX 78251	Abatix Corporation 610 Lanark, Suite 203A San Antonio, TX 78218	W Supply, LLC 4601 S Pinemont Dr. Houston, TX 77041	Baytech Supply	CCP Industries, Inc.												
4.	1,500 pairs Rubber coated, nb knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Size X Large, Lawson No. 12948	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4 36 6,540.00	5 01 7,515.00	2 68 4,020.00	5 12 7,680.00	GROUP 4 NOT TABULATED PRODUCT NOT APPROVED	5 32 7,980.00	3 09 4,635.00	4 59 6,885.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID												
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 pairs Margold/Comasec 113533	12 PIP 55-1635 616314-24112	144 pr/cs MCR 6885XL	6/dz PIP 55-1635/XL		12 pr/bx MCR 55-1635/XL	144 PIP 6885																
5.	500 pairs Rubber coated, nb knit lined gloves (Gauntlet style) (Item A-4 per SAWS Specifications for basic personal glovegear attached) Gloves Astro Flex, Size XX Large, Lawson No. 34333	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	4 36 2,180.00	5 01 2,505.00	2 68 1,340.00	5 12 2,560.00		5 32 2,660.00	3 09 1,545.00	4 59 2,295.00															
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 pairs Margold/Comasec 113534	12 PIP 55-1635 616314-24129	144 pr/cs MCR 6885XXL	6/dz PIP 55-1635/XXL		12 pr/bx MCR 55-1635/XXL	144 PIP 6885																
<b>GROUP 4 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	13,716.56	15,761.46 15,753.58 Discount	8,431.28 8,262.65 Discount	16,107.52		16,736.72	9,721.14	14,440.14															
<b>GROUP 5</b>																									
1.	GLOVE A-5 GLOVE: GENERAL PURPOSE GLOVE (9 1/2 INCH) 144 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached). Size 6, Lawson No. 12956	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	6 05 871.20	5 99 862.56	3 43 493.92	6 01 865.44		4 32 622.08	5 40 777.60	3 41 491.04				5 63 810.72	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID								
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/144 pr Memphis Glone 9672 XS	12 PIP 19-D150 616314-59537	144 pr/cs MCR 92723PUXS	1/dz Memphis 9672XS		12 Magid GPD546-6	144 MCR 9672S	12 pr/bx MCR 92723PU				144 Memphis 9672											
2.	600 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 7, Lawson No. 12957	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3 76 2,256.00	5 99 3,594.00	3 43 2,058.00	6 01 3,606.00		4 32 2,592.00	5 40 3,240.00	3 41 2,046.00				5 63 3,378.00				BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID					
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/144 pr MCR Safety 92723PU-S	12 PIP 19-0158 616314-21817	144 pr/cs MCR 92723PUS	1/dz Memphis 9672S		12 Magid GPD546-7	144 MCR 9672M	12 pr/bx MCR 92723PU				144 Memphis 9672											
3.	1,500 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2", Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 8, Lawson No. 12958	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3 76 5,640.00	5 99 8,985.00	3 43 5,145.00	6 01 9,015.00	4 32 6,480.00	5 40 8,100.00	3 41 5,115.00	5 63 8,445.00	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID												
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/144 pr MCR Safety 92723PU-M	12 PIP 19-D150 616314-21800	144 pr/cs MCR 92723PUM	1/dz Memphis 9672M	12 Magid GPD546-8	144 MCR 9672L	12 pr/bx MCR 92723PU	144 Memphis 9672															
4.	4,000 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2" Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 9, Lawson No. 12959	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3 76 15,040.00	5 99 23,960.00	3 43 13,720.00	6 01 24,040.00	4 32 17,280.00	5 40 21,600.00	3 41 13,640.00	5 63 22,520.00				BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM							NO BID	NO BID			
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/144 pr MCR Safety 92723PU-L	12 PIP 19-0150 616314-21794	144 pr/cs MCR 92723PUL	1/dz Memphis 9672L	12 Magid GPD546-9	144 MCR 9672XL	12 pr/bx MCR 92723PU	144 Memphis 9672															
5.	7,000 pairs General Propose, 9 1/2" Material Polyurethane Liner Seamless knit, cuff elasticize (SAWS specifications 600-34 for basic personal glovegear attached) Size 10, Lawson No. 12955	UNIT PRICE TOTAL	3 76 26,320.00	5 99 41,930.00	3 43 24,010.00	6 01 42,070.00	4 32 30,240.00	5 40 37,800.00	3 41 23,870.00	5 63 39,410.00													BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	12 dz/144 pr MCR Safety 92723PU-XL	12 PIP 19-D150 616314-21824	144 pr/cs MCR 92723PUXL	1/dz Memphis 9672XL	12 Magid GPD546-10	144 MCR 9672XXL	12 pr/bx MCR 92723PU	144 Memphis 9672															
<b>GROUP 5 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	50,127.20	79,331.56 78,291.89 Discount	45,426.92 44,518.38 Discount	79,596.44	57,214.08	71,517.60	45,162.04	74,563.72															

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
**P. O. BOX 2449**  
**SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449**  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL Annual Contract for  
 FOR Personal Protective Glovegear  
 TIME & (June 1, 2015 through May 31, 2016)  
 DATE 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2015

ITEM NO	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY		Saf-T-Gove, Inc. 1121 Fountain Pkwy Grand Prairie, TX 7550	R. S. Hughes Co 5018 Service Center Drive San Antonio, TX 78218	Safety Supply, Inc 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Alamo Iron Works 943 AT&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Magid Glove & Safety 1300 Naperville Drive Romeoville, IL 60446	Mastermans, LLP 11 C Street Auburn, MA 01501	Sunbelt Mill Supply 7715 Grissom Rd San Antonio, TX 78251	Abatix Corporation 610 Lazark, Suite 203A San Antonio, TX 78218	W Supply, LLC 4601 S Pinemont Dr. Houston, TX 77041	Baytech Supply	CCP Industries, Inc.				
<b>GROUP 6</b>																	
1.	24 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material supported nitrile Color Blue Length 26" Sizes 8 (Medium)(Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42945	UNIT PRICE	19 76	18 46	19 52	17 97	20 90	18 96	18 25	BID NOT TABULATED VENDOR WITHDREW GROUP 6	BID NOT TABULATED DID NOT RETURN ADDENDUM	NO BID	NO BID				
		TOTAL	474 24	443 04	468 48	431 28	501 60	455 04	438 00								
2.	48 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material supported nitrile Color Blue Length 26" Sizes 9 (Large) (Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42946	UNIT PRICE	19 76	18 46	19 52	17 97	20 90	18 96	18 25								
		TOTAL	948 48	886 08	936 96	862 56	1,003 20	910 08	876 00								
3.	48 pairs Glove Chemical Resistant reusable material supported nitrile Color Blue Length 26" Sizes 10 (X-Large) (Items A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42947	UNIT PRICE	19 76	18 46	19 52	17 97	20 90	18 96	18 25								
		TOTAL	948 48	886 08	936 96	862 56	1,003 20	910 08	876 00								
4.	24 pairs Glove Chemical Resistance reusable material supported nitrile Color Blue Length 26" Sizes 11 (XX-Large) (Item A-6 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer North (Honeywell) Model NK803ESIN, Lawson No. 42948	UNIT PRICE	19 76	18 46	19 52	17 97	20 90	18 96	18 25								
		TOTAL	474 24	443 04	468 48	431 28	501 60	455 04	438 00								
<b>GROUP 6 TOTAL</b>		TOTAL	2,845 44	2,658 24 2,656 91 Discount	2,810 88 2,754 66 Discount	2,587 68	3,009 60	2,730 24	2,628 00								
<b>GROUP 7</b>																	
1.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer length 14" Sizes 7 (Small) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer HexArmor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42941	UNIT PRICE	34 45	34 11	34 11	38 07	34 65	35 58	31 81					BID NOT TABULATED VENDOR WITHDREW GROUP 7			
		TOTAL	413 40	409 32	409 32	456 84	415 80	426 96	381 72								
2.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" Sizes 8 (Medium) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer Hex Armor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42942	UNIT PRICE	34 45	34 11	34 11	38 07	34 65	35 58	31 81								
		TOTAL	413 40	409 32	409 32	456 84	415 80	426 96	381 72								
3.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" sizes 9 (Large) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached) Manufacturer Hex Armor Model SharpMaster II 9014, Lawson No. 42943	UNIT PRICE	34 45	34 11	34 11	38 07	34 65	36 00	31 81								
		TOTAL	413 40	409 32	409 32	456 84	415 80	432 00	381 72								

**SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM**  
 P. O. BOX 2449  
 SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS 78298-2449  
**TABULATION OF BIDS**

PROPOSAL FOR TIME & DATE ITEM NO. Annual Contract for Personal Protective Glovegear (June 1, 2015 through May 31, 2016) 3:00 p.m., April 27, 2015 DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

ITEM NO.	DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY	UNIT	Saf-T-Glove, Inc. 1121 Fountain Pkwy Grand Prairie, TX 7550	R. S. Hughes Co. 5018 Service Center Drive San Antonio, TX 78218	Safety Supply, Inc. 11827 Tech Com Rd., Ste. 114 San Antonio, TX 78260	Alamo Iron Works 943 AT&T Center Parkway San Antonio, TX 78219	Magid Glove & Safety 1300 Naperville Drive Romeoville, IL 60446	Mastermans, LLP 11 C Street Auburn, MA 01501	Sunbelt Mill Supply 7715 Grissom Rd San Antonio, TX 78251	Abatix Corporation 610 Lanark, Suite 203A San Antonio, TX 78218	W Supply, LLC 4601 S Pinedmont Dr. Houston, TX 77041	Baytech Supply	CCP Industries, Inc.	
4.	12 pairs Glove Needlestick resistancer Length 14" Sizes 10 (X-Large) (Item A-7 per SAWS specifications for basic personal protective glovegear attached). Manufacturer HexArmor Model SharpMaster II 9014	PRICE TOTAL	36.10 433.20	35.93 431.16	34.11 409.32	38.07 456.84	34.65 415.80	37.46 449.52	34.01 408.12	BID NOT TABULATED VENDOR WITHDREW GROUP 7				
	Box Quantity Mfg. Quoting Part No.	BX QTY MAKE MODEL	HexArmor 9014-XL	HexArmor 9014 Sz 10	HexArmor 9014-XL 10	HexArmor 9014 - 10		HexArmor 9014-10	Honeywell NK803ESIN					
	<b>GROUP 7 TOTAL</b>	TOTAL	1,673.40	1,659.12 1,658.29 Discount	1,637.28 1,604.53 Discount	1,827.36	1,663.20	1,735.44	1,553.28					
	<b>EXTENSION 1</b>				135,474.70	2,587.68			1,553.28					
	<b>EXTENSION 2</b>				135,474.70	2,587.68			1,553.28					
	<b>EXTENSION 3</b>				135,474.70	2,587.68			1,553.28					
	Terms		Net 30 days	.05% 19 days	2% 10 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days	Net 30 days				
	Delivery Days		5 days	1 day	1-2 days	7-10 days	5-7 days	30 days	7 day	3-5 days				

**\*LOW BIDDER**

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY

W Supply, LLC  
 Abatix Corporation  
 Alamo Iron Works  
 Baytech Supply  
 Grainger  
 Magid Glove & Safety  
 Mapa Distribution

Mastermans, LLP  
 R S Hughes Co  
 Royall Matthiessen  
 Safety Supply, Inc  
 Saf-T-Glove  
 Sunbelt Mill Supply

Demandstar  
 SAWS Website